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CityWest Retail Center — Location

Trade Area

1 Mile 3 Miles 5 Miles

2024 Population
20,889 187,313 552,738

Est. Households
10,112 78,518 220,992

Est. Average 
Household Income

$79,621 $100,603 $94,194

Total  
Employees

11,814 97,769 284,389

	■ Prime Westheimer Rd Location with ± 56,133 
vehicles per day, and less than 1 mile from Beltway 
8 which sees ± 152,556 vehicles per day

	■ Near signalized high-traffic intersection at 
Westheimer Rd and Beltway 8

	■ Dense Residential Area: Over 220,000 
households within a 5-mile radius

	■ PENDING LEASE: 2nd Generation Restaurant End 
Cap Opportunity with Patio Space + Signage

Property Highlights
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CityWest Retail Center — Immediate Trade Area
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CityWest Retail Center — Proximity to Beltway 8
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CityWest Retail Center — Availability & Tenant Mix
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CityWest Retail Center — Site Plan



The information contained herein is used solely for 
the purpose of illustrating both current and prospec-
tive tenants or companies within or near the proper-
ty.  Although Read King Commercial has obtained 
the information contained herein from sources it 
believes to be reliable, and believes the information 
to be correct, no representations or warranties, 
express or implied, are made as to the accuracy or 
reliability of this information. The enclosed drawings 
may not be to scale and any references to square 
footage are approximate only. The recipient bears 
sole responsibility for verification of the accuracy 
of the information contained herein and bears all 
risk for any inaccuracies. All logos displayed are for 
identification purposes only and may be trademarks 
of their respective companies.

Demographics: This report was produced using 
data from private and government sources deemed 
to be reliable. The information herein is provided 
without representation or warranty. Source: Esri 
forecasts for 2024 and 2029. U.S. Census Bureau 
2000 and 2010 decennial Census data converted 
by Esri into 2020 geography.
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For Leasing Opportunities

Matt McKinnerney
Vice President – Leasing
mmckinnerney@read-king.com
713.980.4722
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Vice President – Leasing
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713.980.4753

Julian Fertitta
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